
1

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-4051

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Transmission Parts and Service
FOR:  
TIME & (October 1, 2019 through September 30, 2020)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 27, 2019  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 1 ALL MAKES & MODELS TRANSMISSION PARTS  
 SAWS estimates that it will spend $20,000 on Transmission  
 Parts annually  
A) Parts   20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00

 Percent 10% 15% 20% NO BID
1. Based on Unit Cost Plus Vendor Markup Percentage Total 22,000.00 23,000.00 24,000.00

  
      
2. Product identification (Mfg.) / Verified by Invoice     
ITEM 2 SERVICE   

   
 SAWS estimates that it will require 200 hours of service annually   
 Labor

 Rate 40.00 44.00 95.00 NO BID
A. Labor Rate for in Shop Service Total 8,000.00 8,800.00 19,000.00
    

 Cost  
B. Up-Charge for Outside Labor, Cost Plus Plus 10% 10% 10%
    

 Pickup   
C. Parts will be available for pickup Days  3 days 3 days

 8:00 a.m. - 7:30 a.m. - 8:00 a.m. -
Bus. 6:00 p.m. 6:00 p.m. 6:00 p.m.

D. Business Hours Hours 6 days per week 5 days/week 5 days/week
*

TOTAL ITEM 1 & 2 TOTAL 28,000.00 28,800.00 39,000.00
ITEM 3 WARRANTY     

Required minimum warranty on Re-Build Transmission: (2) years or 24,000 miles  2 Years or 2 Years or 2 Years or NO BID
 WARRANTY OFFERED Warranty 24,000 miles 24,000 miles 24,000 miles
ITEM 4 TOWING

TOWING:  NO CHARGE: 5 miles 5 miles 0 miles
Additional miles 2.50/mile 2.50/mile  NO BID

EXTENSION 1 28,000.00
 

EXTENSION 2 28,000.00

EXTENSION 3 28,000.00

Net Net 1%
Terms 30 days 30 days 10 days

 
Delivery Days  

 

BIDS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

A Best Transmission and Clutch Repair Gonzalez Auto Parts Demandstar
A+ Transmission High Tech Transmission SAWS Website
AAMCO Transmission Mr. Transmission
Better Transmission LLC Select Transmission and Automotive Center
Coxco Transmission Southern Tire Mart
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